

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
 2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
 Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
 Belts

Part Number	Description	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	**IEH Parts/Auto Plus Auto Parts	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.
1843218C1	Belt	Fleetrite FLTBT510K6 \$11.95	Gates K060509 \$13.12	\$22.12
1839964C1	Belt	Fleetrite FLTBT705K8 \$21.50	Gates K080702 \$33.91	\$29.67
1847678C1	Belt	Fleetrite FLTBT720K10 \$39.00	Gates K100720HD \$22.89	\$33.50
1847677C1	Belt	Fleetrite FLTBT732K10 \$23.80	Gates K100731 \$22.69	\$31.52
Discount for other items not on bid		-	* Reference Price	0%

NB = No Bid

\* = Less 61% - Refer to NYS contract #PC68524

\*\* = Non Compliant

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
International Brakes

Part Number	Description	Bus Parts Warehouse	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.
1670176C1/2605073C1	Brake Drum	NB	2605073C1 \$143.80	\$146.33
3531662C1/23-123550004	Brake Rotor	NB	FLT170014951 \$103.50	23123550009 \$98.53
990952C93/FPD184HD	Hydraulic Brake Pad	NB	FLTH184 \$66.75	FLTH184 \$74.31
KRS2014707QP	Brake Shoes/rear with Spring Kit	NB	PKSMA2124707QP \$64.80	KSR2014707QP \$150.82
KRS2014702QP	Brake Shoes/With Spring Kit	NB	KSMA2124702QP \$73.75	KSMA2124702QP \$86.82
SMRK3030L/ZAJ323008X	Piggy Back 30-30	NB	FLTK3030LB24 \$43.75	FLTK3030L24 \$46.59
ZAJ1416001	Air Brake Chamber	NB	FLTS16520 \$18.50	\$48.07
3561639C1	Inversion Valve	3561639C1 \$214.25	BX800969 \$257.00	\$394.45
3628539C92	Quick Release Valve	NB	BX802744 \$33.50	BX802744 \$39.47
BX101818	Brake Valve(Treadle)	NB	FLTB4818 \$110.50	BX101818N \$264.72

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
 2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
 Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
 International Brakes

Part Number	Description	Bus Parts Warehouse	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.
BX275491B1	D2 Air Compressor Governor	170275491 \$11.00	BXOR275491X \$14.40	BXOR275491X \$15.98
1677210C91	Brake Switch Assembly(Hydraulic)	NB	\$14.20	FPH8203 \$16.52
990956C91	Brake Caliper Kit	NB	FPH8203 \$31.30	\$34.37
R802446	Slack Adjuster	1392832 \$58.00	R803048 \$67.50	\$89.36
R802447	Slack Adjuster	1392833 \$58.00	R803049 \$67.50	\$89.36
R803196/1694294C1	Slack Adjuster	NB	R803196 \$69.00	\$86.82
BX801479	Valve ABS Front	170801479 \$285.30	BXK1289160R \$203.00	BXK1289160R \$231.09
ZAJ1621901	Front Brake Chamber	NB	\$67.00	\$76.01
Discount for other items not on bid		74.25%	-	0%

NB = No Bid

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
Bulbs

Part Number	Description	Bus Parts Warehouse	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.
4049850C91	Horn	NB	\$58.50	\$80.47
2506796C1	Inst. Cluster Bulb	NB	\$4.50	\$7.18
9007	Head Lamp Bulb-Halogen	9007 \$2.25	FLT9007 \$2.20	FLT9007 \$2.26
H3	Bulb	H312V55W \$2.50	NB	TLD80571 \$2.64
194	Bulb	NB	FLT194 \$0.16	FLT194 \$0.17
1157	Bulb	NB	FLT1157 \$0.17	FLT1157 \$0.17
3156	Bulb	NB	FLT3156 \$0.65	FLT3156 \$0.66
3157	Bulb	NB	FLT3157 \$0.47	FLT3157 \$0.48
GEH6054	Head Lamp Bulb	H6054 \$6.75	FLTH6054 \$6.45	FLTH6054 \$6.60
436984001	Stop Turn Led Rear 4"	NB	FLT400012A \$8.00	NB
1618678C91	Left Turn Hood Mounted	NB	\$38.00	NB
1618679C91	Right Turn Hood Mounted	NB	\$38.00	NB
2036582C1	Connector	NB	\$14.00	\$14.59
TL44302R	Tail Light	NB	TLD44302R \$17.70	\$19.72
WEL31030110	Back Up Lamps	NB	NB	2227225C1 \$15.25
SIG92WD	Back Up Lights	92WD 13.50	ZBJD620215 \$12.75	TLD92WD \$14.72

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
 2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
 Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
 Bulbs

Part Number	Description	Bus Parts Warehouse	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.
1156	Bulb	NB	FLT1156 \$0.21	\$0.21
1156DC	Bulb	NB	FLT1156 \$0.21	427941040 \$10.42
GR27E0013	7" Directional/Amber LED	M90081Y \$23.25	NB	TLD912414 \$46.71
GR27E0012	7" Stop/Red LED	M90061R \$23.25	NB	TLD91241R \$42.63
Discount for other items not on bid		74.25%	-	0%

NB = No Bid

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
 2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
 Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
 Exhaust

Part Number	Description	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.	School Bus Parts Co.
AJNAVCE 451	Over Axle Back Half	NB	3589451C1 \$407.99	<sup>(1)</sup> XH466AXR \$116.09
AJNAVCE427	Over Axle Front Half	NB	3562427C1 \$215.33	<sup>(1)</sup> XH466AXF \$82.21
482168C1/XH4AX	Over Axle Pipe	482168C4 \$221.00	\$249.67	<sup>(1)</sup> XH4AX \$96.00
482626C1/XH4TR1	Rear Tail Pipe	577265C1 \$335.00	577265C1 \$378.07	<sup>(1)</sup> XH4TR1 \$80.00
1668840C1 Short Pipe	360 Intermediate Pipe	\$200.00	\$231.52	<sup>(1)</sup> XH4TF14 \$110.00
1668845C1 Long Pipe	360 Intermediate Pipe	1668846C2 \$410.00	1668846C2 \$463.28	<sup>(1)</sup> XH4TF9 \$125.00
49256C1	4" Hanger	NB	NB	XQH4 \$13.41
492565C1	Muffler Strap	\$80.00	\$90.39	XHST \$24.00
476235C1	Pipe	NB	NB	NB
<b>Band Strap Type Clamps:</b>				
EC30PBA/XSC3	3" Butt Clamp	FLTEC30PBA \$6.00	FLTEC30PBA \$6.66	XSC3 \$8.22
EC35PBA/XS312	3 1/2" Butt Clamp	FLTEC35PBA \$6.00	FLTEC35PBA \$6.69	XSC312 \$8.31
EC40PBA/XSC4	4" Butt Clamp	FLTXC40PBA \$6.20	FLTXC40PBA \$6.77	XSC4 \$8.46
EC30PLA/XSC3-R	3" Lap Clamp	FLTEC30PLA \$5.50	FLTEC30PLA \$5.79	XSC3-R \$8.31
EC35PLA/XSC312-R	3 1/2" Lap Clamp	FLTEC35PLA \$6.00	FLTEC35PLA \$6.44	XSC312-R \$8.11
EC40PLA/XSC4-R	4" Lap Clamp	\$6.00	FLTEC40PLA \$6.56	XSC4-R \$8.64
2202541C3T	Windshield	FLTDW016450PK1 \$120.00	FLTDW016450PK1 \$128.19	NB
2202543C3	Side Window	\$138.00	\$151.16	NB
Discount for other items not on bid		-	0%	25%

NB = No Bid

<sup>(1)</sup> Parts are not made well. They are weak and do not last.

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
 2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
 Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
 Filters

<b>Part Number</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.</b>	<b>Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.</b>
3532799C1	Air Filter	AF25707 \$58.80	AF25707 \$40.92
1843162C1	Fuel Filter	1843162C91 \$29.50	\$32.88
1873917C91	Fuel Filter	1878042C93 \$46.00	FS19947 \$39.36
1878042C91	Fuel Filter	1878042C93 \$46.00	FS19947 \$39.36
FF63009	Fuel Filter (Cummins)	\$29.00	\$29.37
FF1056	Fuel Filter	NB	FF5112 \$6.38
LF9025	Oil Filter	\$42.00	\$28.00
LF16166	Oil Filter	\$18.00	\$12.14
LF16242	Oil Filter	\$4.75	\$3.28
BX107794B1	Air Dryer Filter Kit AD9	BX107794X \$21.90	FLT107794 \$12.26
29539579	Transmission Filter for 2000 Series	\$12.00	FLT7108 \$4.08
24539579	Transmission Filter	NB	NB
LF3970	Filter (Cummins)	\$10.50	\$7.28
Discount for other items not on bid		-	0%

NB = No Bid

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
 2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
 Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
 Fluids & Lubricants

Item	Quantity	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.
Transynd-Transmission Fluid	5 Gallon	FLTATF295P \$188.00
Chassis Lube	120LB Drum	NB
Ethylene glycol Base Anti-Freeze	55 Gallon Drum	NB
Windshield Washer Fluid -25	55 Gallon Drum	NB
Brake Cleaner	Spray Can	ZDEM720 \$3.15
Penetrating Oil	Spray Can	NB
K-100D Additive	55 Gallon	NB
7295-04 GoJo Power Gold	Hand Cleaner Refill	NB
FLTFQ - Diesel Exhaust Fluid	55 Gallon	\$190.00
Discount for other items not on bid		-

NB = No Bid



Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
Miscellaneous

Part Number	Description	Bus Parts Warehouse	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.
CR35066/37001A	CR Axle Seal (Front)	Automann 181A35066 \$16.00	CR35066 \$27.30	394894C91 \$26.60
387870	Seal	Automann 181A38782 \$22.00	CR38780 \$34.50	CR38780 \$40.63
370023A	Axle Seal	Automann 181370023A \$22.00	CR38780 \$34.50	380019C91 \$41.54
2503294C1	Axle Pinnion Seal	NB	\$62.00	\$67.76
2598644C1	Stepwell Motor	1099017 \$52.50	\$78.00	\$96.56
2598648C1	Uder Seat Motor	HM130 \$34.75	\$39.00	\$98.37
466883001	Washer Pump	NB	446883001 \$39.00	\$48.57
2585952C1	Emcy. Brake Pull	NB	BX801526 \$11.00	BX801526 \$12.13
453261001	Ent. Door Release Cable	NB	\$32.00	\$44.57
62-102	Back Up Alarms	6102DB \$16.00	NB	BU2000CW107 \$13.86
0001133	Back Up Alarms	NB	NB	FLTBUA12V \$12.42
449428020	Heater Assembly	1099077 \$52.50	2598644C1 \$78.00	2598644C1 \$96.56
1873217C2	Tensioner Pulley	NB	\$150.00	\$172.63
3544774C2	Fan Driver 4735-43787	NB	NB	2597644C1 \$96.56
1841217C91	IPR-Pressure Regulator	NB	\$330.00	\$400.59
18783629C94	IPR-Pressure Regulator	NB	1878629C95 \$195.00	\$215.21
1807329	ICP-Pressure Control Sensor	Dorman 1807329C92 \$141.00	1807329C92 \$142.00	\$164.04
1878285C91	Injector	NB	\$250.00	264.12

Brunswick Central School District - aka Tamarac/Brittonkill  
 2019-20 BID TABULATIONS  
 Bus, Auto Truck Parts Bid - 19/20-4  
 Miscellaneous

Part Number	Description	Bus Parts Warehouse	H.L. Gage Sales, Inc.	Leonard Bus Sales, Inc.
184648C	EBPMaxforce	NB	1846480C2 \$48.00	1846480C2 \$53.74
SMC 170	Plate	170 \$4.00	\$4.50	\$4.98
SMC 2167	Hindge	2167 \$10.00	\$10.30	\$10.69
SMC 171	Plate	171 \$4.00	\$3.25	\$3.29
2210999C1	Defroster Fan	1299023 \$29.50	\$36.50	\$40.61
ER3365IH	Heated Crossover Mirror	3365IH \$53.00	ZR3365IH \$60.00	ZR3365IH \$62.14
FLT W22	Winter Blades	W22 \$7.00	\$4.80	\$5.42
FLTW20	Winter Blades	W20 \$7.00	\$4.80	\$5.35
ZLTW18	Winter Blades	W18 \$7.00	\$4.80	\$5.35
2204319C3	Side Door Prop Rod	2204319C3 \$56.00	\$25.00	\$30.75
2203819C3	Rear Door Prop Rod	2203819C3 \$27.00	\$30.00	\$37.51
7080383C1	Hose Fuel	NB	\$30.00	\$33.12
1840538C92	Hose Fuel	NB	\$40.00	\$43.80
185557C1	Clip Fuel	NB	1855557C1 \$13.00	\$15.05
GR18DZZ001	Prop Rod	NB	NB	NB
TT802170C	Cover	NB	NB	NB
TT802170	Prop Rod	NB	NB	NB
ZR19ICL	Base Mirror	NB	\$22.00	\$23.89
ZR19ICR	Base Mirror	NB	\$22.00	\$23.59
Discount for other items not on bid		74.25%	-	0%

NB = No Bid